
I

From : TKA. Karthick [mailto: kschemicals@yahoo.com]
Sent: 07 August 2013 12:57
To: PRASHANT RANJAN, SERVICE, EVEREST

Cc: TKA karthick; arulselavam
Subject: Re: AMC - Boosters

Dear Mr.Prasanth,
Thanks for Ur mail reg AMC for our

Boosters.Am very much happy & fully satisfied about Ur

immediate action for rectifying my booster problem by

sending Ur staff Mr.R.K.Patel. Due to Ur proper way of
respon;e of our phone calls & immediate replay of our mail,

now i propose 6 purchase a another new set of boosters from

Ur concerns shortly.
Regarding AMC pls give me one day time

to think over then i will finalize.If i go for AMC U pls add

this services too in my AMC contract.

As per our telephonic discussion i paid RS

2000 to ur staff Mr.R.K.Patel.This for ur kind information.

Thanking U. 
r 

j

With regards & Thanks,
TKA.Karthick,
Kumaraswamy chemicals,
360,Chennai main Road,
L.N.Puram,Panruti-607 1 06.

Cuddalore District,
Tamilnadu,India.
Ph:+91 4142 241642
+91 9003966594
Visit us :www.kschemicals. com

From: "PRASHANT RANJAN, SERVICE, EVEREST" <Orashant.ranian@everestblowers.com>

To:'TKA.Karthick' <kschemicals@vahoo.com>
Gc: colcha.dha@everestblowers.com


